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Subject: Bid Award 528-2013 for Ductile Iron Fittings, Couplings, Pipe Restraints and Grip 
Rings 

Summary Statement: Bids were received for supplying the City with ductile iron fittings, coupl ings, pipe 
restraints and grip rings. The fittings will be used in the water distribution system throughout the City. The number of 
solicitations viewed totaled 34 and 4 bids were received. Similar fittings were divided into eleven groups: A-K. The 
bid submitted by Ferguson Waterworks from Burlington, WA was the lowest bid for Groups A, B, D, F, I and K. 
Lowest bid for Group C, H, and J items were from HD Fowler of Bellingham, WA and the lowest bid for Group E and 
G were submitted by HD Supply Waterworks of Be llingham, WA. 

Previous Council Action: New Bid Submittal for 2013 

Fiscal Impact: Low bid by Ferguson Waterworks for Groups A, B, D, F, I and K total $45, 120.54. Low bid by 
HD Fowler for Groups C, H, and J was $21,498.59. HD Supply Waterworks bid for Groups E and G was $1,782.48. 
All bids include WA sales tax. 

Funding Source: Water Fund 

Attachments: 528-2013 Bid Summary Sheet 

Meeting Activity 

Consent Agenda 

Meeting Date · Staff Recommendation Presented By Time 

16-Sep-2013 Award Bid Ted Carlson, Director Public Works O 

Council Committee: Agenda Bill Contact: 
Bob Bandarra, Ops Superintendent 778-7735 

Reviewed By Initials Date 
J. Gady, Purchasing Supt 
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Committee Actions: E.. Johnston, Asst. Dir PW ~r:;;,3 T. Carlson. pW Director 

Legal · ~t_ <g/t.,tJ/ /7 
Mayor Cf· 3·13 

Council Action: 



City of Bellingham Purchasing Division 
Bid Opening Results 

Solicitation Number: 
Date of Opening: 
Time of Opening: 
Number of Solicitations Provided: 
Number of Solicitations Received: 

Ductile Iron Fittings; Couplings, Pipe Restraints, and Grip Rings 

529-2013 
08/08/2013 
11:00 AM 
34 
4 

The following are the resulls from the public bid opening. The results have not been verified for mathematical accuracy, 
. responsiveness or responsibility of the bidder. They are only the results as announced at the public bid opening. 

~~ ~ ~ ~; 
Comment~: 52b2013fowler.pdf 52b2013hbjaeger.pdf 52b201 3hdsupply.pdf 52b2013ferguson .pdf 

~ 
Spreadsheet: 52b2013sum.pdf 

A B c I D E 
1 HB Jaeger HD Supply !Ferguson Fowler 

2 Burlington Bellingham Burlington Bellingham 

3 Group A Elbows No Bid $ 17,938.01 $ 17,635.39 $ 17,970.08 
4 Group B Sleeves No Bid $ 14,589.08 $ 14,443.83 $ 14,727.47 
5 Group CTees No Bid $ 1,265.68 I s 1,242.08 $ 1,240.09 
6 ~pDCaps No Bid $ 1,634.43 $ 1,610.36 s 1,642.44 -- --7 Group E Plugs No Bid $ 829.07 $ 899.31 ~191.40 
8 Group F Reducers No Bid $ 3,874.41 $ 3,783.87 $ 3,881.26 -- -
9 Group G Adaptors No Bid $ 1,741.77 $ 1,810.05 $ 1,742.49 

10 Group H Couplings $19,256.00 No Bid I s 11,609 .. 22 $ 17,609.14 

11 Group I Macro Couplings No Bid No Bid $ 3,263.19 $ 3,280.14 
12 Group J Pipe Restraints No Bid No Bid -=:J $ 693.71 $ 6 23.72 
13 Group K Grip Rings No Bid No Bid $ 912.03 $ 1,093.76 




